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NOTICE 
Transfer of Equity Shares to Investor Education and Protection Fund (IEPF)  

 
Notice is hereby given that in terms of Section 124(6) of the Companies Act, 2013 read with 
Investor Education and Protection Fund Authority (Accounting, Audit, Transfer and Refund) 
Second Amendment Rules, 2017 ('the Rules'), Equity Shares of the Company for which dividends 
have remained unclaimed or unpaid for seven consecutive years are required to be transferred 
by the Company to the DEMAT Account of Investor Education and Protection Fund (IEPF) of the 
Government of India.  
 
Adhering to the various requirements set out in the Rules, the Company has simultaneously 
communicated individually to the concerned shareholders at their addresses registered with the 
company, inter alia, providing the details of shares liable to be transferred to IEPF DEMAT 
Account.  
 
The Company has also uploaded the full details of such shareholders and shares due to be 
transferred to IEPF DEMAT Account on its website at www.eastindiapharma.org. Shareholders 
are requested to refer to the website to verify the details of uncashed/unclaimed dividends and 
the shares liable to be transferred to IEPF DEMAT Account.  
 
The concerned shareholders may note that upon such transfer, such shares including all 
benefits accruing on such shares, if any, can be claimed back by them only from the IEPF 
Authority by following the procedure prescribed under the Rules.  
 
The concerned Shareholders, holding shares in physical form and whose shares are liable to be 
transferred to the IEPF DEMAT Account, may note that the Company would be issuing duplicate 
share certificate(s) in lieu of the original share certificates held by them for the purpose of 
transfer of shares to IEPF DEMAT Account as per the Rules and upon such issue, the Original 
Share Certificate(s) which stand registered in their name will stand automatically cancelled and 
shall be deemed non-negotiable.  
 
In case the Company does not receive any valid claim from the concerned shareholders on or 
before 30th September, 2024, the Company shall, with a view to comply with the Rules, transfer 
the shares to the DEMAT Account of IEPF by the due date as per the procedure stipulated in the 
Rules.  
 
For any further information or to register a valid claim on the shares, please write to 
dcs@eastindiapharma.org.  
 
 
 
Date: 03.07.2024                 For East India Pharmaceutical Work Limited    
Place: Kolkata           Sd/- 

             Jayeeta Sarkar 
                      Company Secretary  
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